
RSG Mexico Conference 2022 
 

3rd & 4th APRIL 2022 
 

Venue: Planetarium Ka Yok, Av. Av Tulum y Nichupte, 
Supermanzana 11 M2 L3, 77504 Cancún, Q.R., Mexico 

 
Organiser: Karen Fuentes, Manta Caribbean Project 

 
Summary of conference objectives: 
The objective of the conference is for RSG grantees to present their research, 
conservation, and educational projects funded by The Rufford Foundation. It was an 
opportunity for grantees to present their work to their peers, showing how impactful, 
and game-changing their projects have been. Through their project’s how they have 
developed the conservation or research strategies in ecosystems or species within 
Mexico and other countries in Latin America. 
 
The conference: 
After two days of incredible presentations of remarkable projects during the 
conference in the Planetarium Ka Yok in Cancun 2022, and a field trip to a Flora and 
Fauna Natural Protected Area read about the highlights during this event. 
 
On the first day of the Rufford Small Grant Conference, we welcomed the grantees 
to the Planetarium Ka Yok, Cancun. The Director of The Manta Caribbean Project 
gave a keynote presentation related to mantas and devil rays research and 
conservation in the Mexican Caribbean region. While some participants were able to 
attend the conference, other grantees presenting their conservation and research 
work through a virtual platform set up for this event, a total of seventeen attendees. 
 
The objective of the conference was for RSG grantees to present their research, 
conservation, and educational projects funded by The Rufford Foundation. The first 
day presenters explain how their work has been impactful, and game-changing for 
their established objectives in the region where they develop their conservation or 
research strategies in ecosystems or species within Mexico and other countries in Latin 
America. 
 
From sea turtles’ health, Chondrichthyes species in Oaxaca coastline, ongoing 
genetics research in the Mesoamerican coral reef, women's traditional medicine 
knowledge in the tropical forest, mountain ecosystems, ecology and conservation of 
bats, temperate forest, and biological and co-evolution of moths. Restoration, 
conservation, research, and communities-based projects related to ecosystems and 
species were some of the highlights during the first day of the congress. 
 
The richness of biodiversity was presented during this first day, different individuals 
working towards sustainability, conservation, their leadership, and The Rufford 
Foundation support has contributed substantially to projects within Mexico and Latin-
American countries that have improved the awareness, knowledge, lifestyles within 
their communities, and improve scientific knowledge. 



 
The importance of financial support for conservation and research projects is 
fundamental for the development of initiatives and strategies that help to sustain 
fragile ecosystems, poorly studied species, face climate change and the current 
climate crisis, including vulnerable and endangered habitats, with the ultimate goal 
to raise awareness, increase knowledge, and improve scientific literature that creates 
along with the collaboration with local communities, academic institutions, non-
governmental organizations or governmental entities, and the private sector. 
 
Grantees exposed some of the key factors for the degradation of ecosystems as a 
result of deforestation, cattle raising, monocultures, lack of legal framework, 
overfishing, climate crisis, and communities’ inequality. 
 
On the second day, we started our day early morning with a field trip visiting The 
Natural Protected Flora and Fauna Mangroves of Nichupté. Our local guides took us 
on an adventure around the vulnerable mangroves’ ecosystems where through the 
tour different species of birds and coastal ecosystems were spotted. Furthermore, the 
expedition allowed the RSG grantees to interact with each other and enjoy nature 
during this conference and get to know one of the most emblematic ecosystems in 
Quintana Roo State. 
 
The main conference started with Dr. Ramon Bonfil an academic from ECOSUR 
campus Chetumal, and CEO of his own non-profit organization Océanos Vivientes, 
with the title: Environmental DNA of Sawfishes in Mexico. 
 
The talks continued with a series of presentations related to microplastic and other 
pollutants in whale sharks in Bahía Magdalena, sustainable gray whale watching in 
Baja California Peninsula, sea turtle species population trends in Oaxaca, Avitourism, 
and more. 
 
Sharing experiences, and knowledge and improving our way of thinking could 
potentially help to develop more effective and efficient proposals, assessments, 
planning, and approach to our professional journeys depending on our work efforts, 
regions, culture, and field of expertise. 
 
We want to thank The Rufford Foundation for their support during the last years, and 
we wish you the best of luck for future potential projects. 
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Figure 1. Rufford Conference, Cancun, Mexico April 2022 

 


